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Terms and Conditions  
BOOSTfit Instructor Training includes access to a back catalogue of BOOSTfit choreography, online 
support group and regular meetings via zoom. There will be a 1-day training assessment followed by 
a  certificate upon completion of all requirements 

Requirements 

You will need a Level 2 Movement to Music qualification or equivalent as a prerequisite to become 
an Independent Contractor with BOOSTfit. We recommend an up to date first aid certificate and full 
insurance. You must submit any relevant certificates to us. You will need access to a computer and 
internet to use the routines and Facebook support group. 

 

BOOSTfit code of conduct 

This Code of Conduct has been created so that all our instructors could grow successful classes 
working in harmony with their BOOSTfit team. 

1) Introduce yourself to any new instructors in the area. Our community is a great way to get class 
cover and promote BOOSTfit on a wider scale. Remember we are a team, not competitors. 

2) Unless there has been an official agreement from BOOSTfit in writing, do not launch classes on 
the same day, time or location as another instructor. This puts you in direct competition and will 
make it harder for both parties to grow their classes. The decision to allow an instructor to hold a 
BOOSTfit class under these conditions is at the discretion of BOOSTfit and needs to be confirmed in 
writing before the class can go ahead. 

To check for local classes please contact BOOSTfit or visit www.boostfit.com 

All new classes must be confirmed via BOOSTfit. They will be added onto the website and an event 
will be created which you can then share.  

3) Unless there has been an official agreement in writing do not launch classes at a venue where 
another instructor is teaching BOOSTfit. Teaching at the same venue will make it difficult for both of 
you to grow your classes as there will only be a limited number of potential customers. 

4) Be friendly, professional and live our ethos. Do not badmouth other instructors, companies or 
class participants (including via social media). Defamation regarding BOOSTfit will not be tolerated. 
Negative comments reflect badly on you as an instructor and on BOOSTfit as a company. Remember, 
you’re all working together as a team. Should a problem arise please firstly speak to us. 

5) Do not share inappropriate or political posts on social media via your BOOSTfit/work profile. 
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BOOSTfit training 

To join the training programme the applicant must fill in all forms accurately and ensure relevant 
qualification are up to date. 

A one-off training fee is required in order to complete the BOOSTfit training. Once confirmation of 
payment is received you will get an email confirmation and access to the training hub. 

If you cancel within 7 days of subscribing to BOOSTfit we will refund you the price paid for your 
training minus any admin fees. If you cancel your training date 4 weeks prior to the day we will 
charge you a rearrangement fee. 

If you cancel your assessment date less than 4 weeks prior to the day a fee will be incurred.  All 
cancelations need to be put into writing and emailed to us. 

If you fail to attend the training you will not receive a refund and the next steps will be emailed to 
you. A fee will be incurred. 

If BOOSTfit cancels training, we will inform you as soon as possible in writing to arrange another day. 
All efforts will be made to make this as convenient to you as possible. No refunds will be available. 

BOOSTfit shall not be liable to refund any fees or for any other penalty should courses be cancelled 
due to war, fire, strike lock-out, pandemic, industrial action, tempest, accident, civil disturbance or 
any other cause whatsoever beyond our control. 

For cancellation due to injury or illness less than 14 days before the course the candidate can be 
transferred over to another course date upon presentation of a doctor’s note. No refund is offered. 

Health Conditions 

If you have an injury, medical condition or if you are going to be pregnant at the time of the course, 
please contact us in advance. 

 

Your Monthly Membership 

This is our Terms and Conditions of Use Agreement (hereinafter referred to as the “Agreement”) for 
use of the BOOSTfit content, One Drive access and Facebook group membership. BOOSTfit is not 
directed to persons under eighteen (18) years of age. All the BOOSTfit content is owned by BOOSTfit 
Ltd. This Agreement applies to all the products and services offered by BOOSTfit and, the mobile 
versions thereof, any software that you have embedded on a web site or are about to embed 
(“Widgets”), and any applications (“Apps”) created by BOOSTfit whether available through a social 
networking site or its subsidiaries or affiliated companies (collectively, “Service”). Please note that 
the availability of any Apps on a social networking site does not indicate any relationship or 
affiliation between BOOSTfit and such social networking site. 

 

If you do not agree to be bound by this Agreement, you may not use or access this monthly 
subscription, and are prohibited from doing so. BOOSTfit reserves the right to refuse or cancel your 
subscription. We also reserve the right to cancel your membership should you violate any provision 
of this Agreement, or any other posted policy as per the membership. The contents of BOOSTfit, 



 

  

 

Reg no.10253 Copyright 2022 BOOSTfit Ltd. All rights reserved. 
 

including the videos, text, graphics, images, and information obtained from third-party content 
providers, sponsors, suppliers, and licensors (collectively “Providers”), and any other materials are to 
be used for informational purposes only. 

Communication 

You consent to receive communications (including legal notices) from us electronically. We will 
communicate with you via email, Facebook, Facebook Messenger, WhatsApp and Zoom calls or by 
posting notices on the BOOSTfit Facebook group. You agree that all agreements, notices, disclosures 
and other communications that we provide to you electronically satisfy any legal requirement that 
such communications be in writing. 

 

Licence and access 

BOOSTfit grants you a limited license to access and use for your personal benefit the BOOSTfit 
programme. You may not download or modify it any portion of it or replace any of the class 
structure, template or breakdown of training. You may not film or share any of the content from The 
BOOSTfit programme, BOOSTfit WhatsApp, BOOSTfit Facebook Group or BOOSTfit messenger group. 
This license does not include any resale of BOOSTfit or its contents; any collection and use of any 
product listings, descriptions, or prices; any derivative use of BOOSTfit or its contents; or any use of 
data mining, robots, or similar data gathering and extraction tools. You may not frame or utilise any 
framing techniques to enclose any trademark, logo, or other proprietary information (including 
images, text, page layout, or form) of BOOSTfit without our express written consent. You may not 
use any metatags or any other hidden text utilizing BOOSTfit's name or trademarks. Any 
unauthorised use terminates the permission or license granted by BOOSTfit. You may not use any 
BOOSTfit logo or other proprietary graphic or trademark as part of the link without express written 
permission. We may revoke the license granted to you at any time for any reason. 

Your BOOSTfit Social Media Accounts 

If you subscribe to BOOSTfit Instructor training, you are responsible for maintaining the 
confidentiality of your account and password and for restricting access to your computer, and you 
agree to accept responsibility for all activities that occur under your account or password. BOOSTfit 
and its affiliates reserve the right to refuse service, terminate accounts, remove or edit content, or 
cancel orders in their sole discretion. Memberships are non-transferable. You agree to (a) maintain 
all equipment necessary for your access to and use of the programme; (b) maintain the security of 
confidential information relating to your BOOSTfit membership; (c) take responsibility for all charges 
resulting from use of your BOOSTfit account, including unauthorised use prior to your notifying 
BOOSTfit of such unauthorised use and taking the legal steps to prevent its further occurrence; and 
(d) update your Personal Information, including email address, as appropriate. If subscription is 
terminated due to a violation of this Agreement, BOOSTfit will not issue you a refund of any fees 
paid. BOOSTfit will not issue you a refund for any fees paid when if you cancel your subscription. If 
you display any offensive behaviour towards BOOSTfit staff or clients your access will be frozen, and 
your membership will be cancelled with no refund. 

Membership & cancellation 
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All memberships are renewed automatically each month from the date created, until cancelled.  
Memberships can be cancelled at any time, you will continue to have access to the programme until 
your subscription month expires. You agree to be bound by the renewal subscription and to pay the 
fees required for the renewal subscription, which may be higher than the fees you originally paid. 

You cannot teach BOOSTfit without an active membership account. 

If you wish to reactivate your BOOSTfit membership, your training certificate will remain valid for 12 
months from cancelation date. If you wish to return after a 12 month period, you will be required to 
retrain fully in the BOOSTfit programme.  Any fees will be in accordance with BOOSTfit’s current 
prices and previous deals, fees, offers or incentives will not be applicable. 

 

Orders to BOOSTfit 

Stock orders will need to be made with at least 28 days' notice and payment will be made prior to 
dispatch. You will be supplied with a list of purchasable equipment with prices included. BOOSTfit 
have the rights to cancel your order if you do not pay invoices within 7 days of the amount due. 

 

By joining BOOSTfit the instructor agrees to be bound by the terms and conditions within this 
document.  

 


